




































































For residential log home building thermal envelope consiruction requirements see Section
R402.6.

Table R402.1.4: Delete the rows in Table R402.1.4 for climate zones "5 and Marine 4" and "'6"
and replace with the following:

Table R402.1.4
Equivalent U-Factors

R402.4.1. Building Thermal Envelope. Delete section and replace with the following:

1. Until June 30, 2021, the building thermal envelope shall comply with Sections
R402.4.1.1 (Installation) and either Section R402.4.1.2 (Testing) or Section R402.4.1.3
(Visual inspection).

2. Effective July 1, 2021, the building thermal envelope of a minimum of twenty percent
(20%) of all new single-family homes constructed by each builder shall complv with

Section R402.4.1.1 (Installation) and Section R402.4.1.2 (Testing). The authority having
jurisdiction mav:

2.1. Determine how to enforce this requirement, starting with the fifth house and
continuing with each subsequent fifth house.

2.2. Waive this requirement if significant testing indicates the five (5) air changes per
hour (ACH) requirement is consistently being met or exceeded (resulting in a lower

ACH).

2.3. Grant exceptions to this requirement in rural areas where testing equipment is not
available or cost effective.

3. Effective July 1, 2021, the building thermal envelope of eighty percent (80%) of all new
single-family homes constructed by each builder shall comply with Section R402.4.1.1
(Installation) and either Section R402.4.1.2 (Testing) or Section R402.4.1.3 (Visual

inspection).

4. The sealing methods between dissimilar materials shall allow for differential expansion
and contraction.

R402.4.1.1: Installation. Delete section and replace with the following:

BUILDING CODE ORDINANCE AMENDMENTS 2021 - 24
H:\Community Development\Building\Ordinances and Resclutions\Ordinance 559.docx



The components of the building thermal envelope as listed in Table R402.4.1.1 shall be
installed in accordance with the manufacturer's instructions and the criteria listed in Table
R402.4.1.1 as applicable to the method of construction.

R402.4.1.2: Testing. Delete section and replace with the following:

Testing building envelope tightness and insulation installation shall be considered
acceptable when tested air leakage is less than five (5) air changes per hour (ACH) when
tested with a blower door at a pressure of 33.5 psf (50 Pa). Testing shalil occur after rough
in and after installation of penetrations of the building envelope, including penetrations for
utilities, plumbing, electrical, ventilation and combustion appliances. Testing shall be
conducted in accordance with RESNET/ ICC 380, ASTM E 779 or ASTM E 1827 and
reported at a pressure of 0.2-inch w.g. (50 Pascals). During testing:

1. Exterior windows and doors, fireplace and stove doors shali be closed, but not sealed.

2. Dampers shall be closed, but not sealed, including exhaust, intake makeup air,
backdraft and flue dampers.

3, Interior doors shall be open.

4. Exterior openings for continuous ventilation systems and heat recovery ventilators
shall be closed and sealed.

5. Heating and cooling system(s) shall be turned off.

6. HVAC ducts shall not be sealed.

7. Supply and return registers shall not be sealed.

R402.4.1.3: Visual inspection. Add new section as follows:

Building envelope tightness and insulation installation shall be considered acceptable
when the items listed in Tabie R402.4 1.1 applicable to the method of construction, are field
verified. Where required by code official an approved party independent from the installer
of the insulation shal] inspect the air barrier and insulation.

R402.6: Residential log home thermal envelope. Add new section as follows:

Residential log home construction shali comply with Section R401 (General), Section
R402.4 (Air leakage), Section R402.5 (Maximum fenestration U-factor and SHGC).
Section R403.]1 (Controls), the mandatory sections of Sections R403.3 through R403.9,
Section R404 (Electrical Power and Lighting Systems). and either 1.. 2., or 3. as follows:

1. Sections R402.2 through R402.3. Section R403.3.1 (Insulation), Section (Lightnin
equipment) and Table, R402.6 (Log Home Prescriptive Thermal Envelope
Requirements by Component).

BUILDING CODE ORDINANCE AMENDMENTS 2021 - 25

H:\Community Development\Building\Ordinances and Resolutions\Ordinance 559.docx



2. Section R405 (Simulated Performance Alternative).

3. REScheck (U.S. Department of Energv Building Codes Program).

Add the following as Table R402.6:

Table R402.6
Log Home Prescriptive Thermal Envelope Requirements by Component

For Si: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

2 The fenestration U-factor column excludes skvlights. The SHGC column applies to ali glazed
fenestration.

® R-5 shall be added to the required slab edge R-values for heated slabs.

©90% AFUE natural gas or propane, 84% AFUE oi}, or 15 SEER heat pump heating equipment
(zonal electric resistance heating equipment such as electric base board electric resistance heating

equipment as the sole source for heating is considered compliant with the high efficiency

equipment path).

4 15/19" means R-15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-19
cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall. "15/19" shall be permitied to be met with R-
13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement wali plus R-5 continuous insulated sheathing on
the interior or exterior of the home. "10/13" means R-10 continuous insulated sheathing on the
interior or exterior of the home or R-13 cavitv insulation at the interior of the basement wall.

R403.5.3: Hot water pipe insulation (Prescriptive). Delete section and replace with the
following:

Insulation for hot water piping with a thermal resistance. R-value, of not less than R-3 shall
be applied to the following:

1. Piping serving more than one (i) dwelling unit.

2. Piping located outside the conditioned space.

3. Piping located under a floor slab.

BUILDING CODE ORDINANCE AMENDMENTS 2021 — 26
H:\Community Development\Building\Ordinances and Resolutions\Ordinance 559.docx



4. Buried piping.

5. Supply and return piping in recirculation systems other than demand recirculation
systems.

R404.1: Lighting equipment (Mandatory). Delete section and replace with the following:

A minimum of seventy-five percent (75%) of the lamps in permanently installed lighting

fixtures shall be high-efficacy lamps or a minimum of seventy-five percent (75%) of the
permanently installed lighting fixtures shall contain onlv high efficacy lamps.

R406.3: Energv Rating Index. Delete Section snd replace with the following:

The Energv Rating Index (FR1) shall be determined in accordance with RESNET/ICC 301.
Energy used to recharge or refuel a vehicle used for transporiation on roads that are not on
the building site shall not be included in the ERI reference design or the rated design.

Table R406.4: Delete table and replace with the following:

Table R406.4
Maximum Eneigy Rating Index

2 Where onsite renewable energy is included for compliance using the ERI analysis of Section
R406.4, the building shall meet the mandatory requirements of Section IR406.2, and the building
thermal envelope shall be greater than or equal to the levels of efficiency and SHGC in Table
R402.1.2 or Table R402.1.4 of the 2015 International Energy Conservation Code.

SECTION 7. That Section 7.1.306, Kootenai County Ccde, shall be, and the same is hereby
amended as follows:

7.1.306: AMENDMENTS TO INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE:
The following deletions shall be incorporated intc the 2018 2045 International Property
Maintenance Code adopted pursuant to subsection 7.1.201(F) of this chapter. Section numbers
prior to each item refer to those in the International Property Maintenance Code.

103: Department of Property Maintenance Inspection. Delete section in its entirety.
106.1; Unlawful acts. Delete section.
106.2: Notice of violation. Delete section.

106.3: Prosecution of violation. Delete section.

BUILDING CODE ORDINANCE AMENDMENTS 2021 —27

H:\Community Development\Building\Ordinances and Resolutions\Ordinance 559.docx



106.4: Violation penalties. Delete section.

107.3: Method of service. Delete section.

107.6: Transfer of ownership. Delete section.

108.2.1: Authority to disconnect service utilities. Delete section.
109.4: Emergency repairs. Delete section.

109.5: Costs of emergency repairs. Delete section.

109.6: Hearing. Delete section.

110.3: Failure to comply. Delete section.

110.4: Salvage materials. Delete section.

111: Means of Appeal. Delete section in its entirety.

112: Stop Work Order. Delete section in its entirety.
302.4: Weeds. Delete section.

302.8: Motor vehicles. Delete section.

302.9: Defacement of property. Delete section.

303.1: Swimming pools. Delete section.

304.2: Protective treatment. Delete section.

304.5: Foundation walls. Delete section.

304.6: Exterior walls. Delete section.

304.13: Window, skylight and door frames. Delete section.
304.14: Insect screens. Delete section.

304.15: Doors. Delete section.

304 16: Basement hatchways. Delete section.

304.17: Guards for basement windows. Delete section.
304.18: Building security. Delete section and ali subsecticns thereunder.
304.19: Gates. Delete section.

BUILDING CODE ORDINANCE AMENDMENTS 2021 - 28
H:\Community Development\Building\Ordinances and Resclutions\Ordinance 559.docx



305.1: General. Delete section.

305.3: Interior surfaces. Delete section.

305.6: Interior doors. Delete section.

306.1.1: Unsafe conditions. Delete Item 3 and ali items thereunder.

308.2: Disposal of rubbish. Delete sections and ali subsections thereunder.

308.3: Disposal of garbage. Delete sections and all subsections thereunder.

309: Pest Elimination. Delete section in its entirety.

Chapter 4: Light, Ventilation and Occupancy Limitations. Delete chapter in its entirety.
Chapter 5: Plumbing Facilities and Fixture Requirements. Delete chapter in its entirety.
Chapter 6: Mechanical and Electrical Requirements. Delete chapter in its entirety.
Chapter 7: Fire Safety Requirements. Delete chapter in its entirety.

SECTION 8. That Section 7.1.307, Kootenai County Code, shall be, and the same is hereby
amended as follows:

7.1.307: AMENDMENTS TO INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE: The
following deletions shall be incorporated into the 2018 2645 International Existing Building Code
adopted pursuant to subsection 7.1.201(G) of this chapter. Section numbers prior to each item
refer to those in the International Existing Building Code.

103.2: Appointment. Delete section.
103.3: Deputies. Delete section.
112: Board of Appeals. Delete section in its entirety.

SECTION 9. The provisions of this Ordinance shall repeal and replace all previously adopted
building codes and amendments thereto. Construction on projects initiated under prior codes may
proceed to completion in accordance with the codes in effect at the time of permit application.
Any repair, reconstruction, remodeling, or alteration of existing structures shall conform to the
codes in effect at the time a complete application is received.

SECTION 10. If any provision of this Ordinance shall be declared by a court of appropriate
Jurisdiction to be invalid, such decision shail not affect the validity of remaining portions of this
Ordinance. Any remaining portions shall be interpreted to give effect to the spirit of this Ordinance
prior to removal of the provisions declared invalid.

SECTION 11. Neither the adoption of this Ordinance nor the repeal of any ordinance shall, in
any manner, affect the prosecution for violation of such ordinance committed prior to the effective

BUILDING CODE ORDINANCE AMENDMENTS 20621 - 29
H:\Community Development\Building\Ordinances and Resolutions\Ordinance 559.docx



date of this Ordinance or be construed as a waiver of any license or penalty due under any such
ordinance or in any manner affect the validity of any action heretofore taken by the Kootenai
County Board of Commissioners or Kootenai County Community Development (formerly known
as the Kootenai County Building and Planning Department) or the validity of any such action to
be taken upon matters pending before the Kootenai County Board of Commissioners or Kootenai
County Community Development on the effective date of this Ordinance.

SECTION 12. Notice of adoption of this Ordinance shail be published in one (1) issue of the
Coeur d’Alene Press upon its passage and approval.

SECTION 13. This Ordinance shall take effect and be in full force as of January 1, 2021.

DATED this _| | .m‘/day of December, 2020.

KOOTENAI COUNTY
BOARD OE COMMHSSIONERS

/- .
ﬂw
Chris Fillios, @i

Bill Brooks, Commissioner \s\l_o\gmcmoo@)*,’l,
S&er - XA
-~ &) F 5 -

ATTEST: 5 74 SSTOR YA

JIM BRANNON, CLERK

=03

RV A

7, *Seeee, ' -~

By X 2, Srare ¢ &
eputy Cle ’

Publication Date: December 3% , 2020

C: Community Development, Prosecuting Attorney (Civil and Criminal Divisions), NIBCA, American Legal
Publishing, Ordinance File

BUILDING CODE ORDINANCE AMENDMENTS 2021 - 30
H:\Community Development\Building\Ordinances and Resolutions\Ordinance 559.docx



